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Introduction

Common warts are benign, small, mucocutaneous grainy lesions 
that are caused by human papilloma virus (HPV; particularly 
HPV types 1, 2, 4, 27, 29, and 57), mostly spread by direct contact 
or autoinoculation. They can arise on any part of the body, but 
they more frequently occur on the hands, fingers, feet, and knees. 
Although common warts are generally asymptomatic, they may 
become painful upon application of pressure, particularly when 
they develop on the palms and soles (1).

Oral isotretinoin (13-cis retinoic acid), a synthetic compound 
of the first retinoid generation, is the drug of choice for the treat-
ment of severe and therapy-resistant forms of acne that are un-
responsive to conventional therapy, including systemic antibiot-
ics. Moreover, this retinoid has been successfully applied in the 
systemic treatment of a wide spectrum of benign and malignant 
cutaneous disorders (2). Here we report the rapid and complete 
remission of extensive and recalcitrant common warts in an im-
munocompetent patient after oral isotretinoin monotherapy.

Case report

A 26-year-old HIV-negative and otherwise healthy Caucasian man 
presented with a 30-month-history of multiple warty skin lesions 
on both upper extremities. They had previously been treated by 
other dermatologists with laser, cryotherapy, and topical trichlo-
roacetic acid, but each time they relapsed shortly after completion 
of therapy and became more extensive. His past medical history 
was unremarkable. In particular, he had no diabetes mellitus, re-
current infections, or recreational drug use/abuse. His family his-
tory was also unremarkable.

Physical examination revealed multiple and focally confluent, 
hyperkeratotic, whitish papules with an irregular verrucous sur-

face that were localized on the extensor surface of both under-
arms (Fig. 1A). The results of hematological, biochemical, and se-
rological examinations, including quantitative determination of 
lymphocyte subpopulations and of serum immunoglobulins, se-
rum protein immunoprecipitation, and autoimmune (antinuclear, 
anti-ds-DNA, anti-SM, anti-RNP, anti-SSA, anti-SSB antibodies) 
and tumor markers (α-fetoprotein, carcinoembryonic antigen, Ca 
19-9, prostate-specific antigen, and beta-2-microglobulin), were 
either negative or within normal limits. The results of chest X-ray 
and ultrasound examinations of the abdomen and pelvis were un-
remarkable. Histological examination of a skin biopsy revealed 
typical features of common warts; for example, acanthosis, pap-
illomatosis, hyperkeratosis, compact orthokeratosis with focal 
parakeratosis overlying the papillary tops, hypergranulosis with 
keratohyalin condensation, and perinuclear vacuolization.

Considering the recalcitrance of the lesions of our patient and 
in view of the previously reported impressive therapeutic efficacy 
of oral isotretinoin in an immunosuppressed patient with exten-
sive and recalcitrant common warts (3), the decision was made 
to introduce oral treatment with isotretinoin (1 mg/kg/day; Ro-
taxin, Hadjiconstantinou Bros. Ltd., Limassol, Cyprus). Because 
our patient was 26 years old, age limitations (isotretinoin is not 
indicated for treatment in children < 12 years) were not applicable. 
Written consent was obtained from the patient subsequent to a 
thorough explanation of the possible therapeutic efficacy and the 
known side effects of this retinoid.

Already after 2 weeks of continuous oral isotretinoin treatment, 
a considerable reduction in the number and size of common warts 
could be seen. Complete remission was observed after 6 weeks of 
oral administration of this retinoid (Fig. 1B). The patient devel-
oped cheilitis and dryness of the nasal mucosa with occasional 
epistaxis, whereas his laboratory parameters revealed no signifi-
cant alteration. He has presently completed a 23-month follow-up 
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and shows no evidence of relapse of his skin lesions.

Discussion

In most immunocompetent patients, spontaneous remission of 
common warts is possible, but it often takes a long time, even 
years, to occur (4). Moreover, apart from their tendency to spread, 
common warts cause significant disfigurement and have a nega-
tive impact on the patient’s quality of life; thus, rapid and effective 
therapeutic intervention is warranted in most cases (5). Diverse 
therapeutic approaches include electrocautery, laser ablation, 
and cryosurgery; topical applications of caustic and antimitotic 
drugs or immune modulators have been used in the management 
of common warts, but they are often associated with an unsatis-
factory response, high recurrence rates, and side effects, such as 
severe topical reactions, temporary or permanent discoloration, 
and scarring. Common warts often represent a frustrating thera-
peutic problem, particularly in immunocompromised patients, 
because despite treatment they exhibit a progressive increase in 
their size and area of skin involvement, and they also have the 
potential for malignant transformation into squamous cell carci-
nomas (3).

Data on the treatment of common warts with oral isotretinoin 
are sparse. Katz (6) was the first to report the introduction of this 
compound for the systemic treatment of common warts. About 1 
year after completion of chemotherapy for Hodgkin’s disease, his 
immunosuppressed patient developed large common warts on the 
hands and feet, which were refractory to all conventional forms of 
therapy. Initial oral administration of 1 mg/kg/day of isotretinoin 
over a period of 10 weeks led to a considerable regression of the 
wart on his right foot, but it had limited influence on lesions lo-
cated elsewhere. After 28 weeks of treatment, the isotretinoin dos-
age was decreased to 0.5 mg/kg/day; nevertheless, the patient’s 
foot wart continued to improve, but it grew larger upon further 
reduction of the dosage. Re-administration of 0.5 mg/kg/day was 
reportedly accompanied by clinical improvement of the wart but 

was unable to lead to complete remission of the lesions.
In 2005 our group was the first to report the complete remission 

of extensive and recalcitrant common warts after 10 weeks of oral 
isotretinoin therapy at a dose of 1 mg/kg/day in an immunocom-
promised patient (low-grade B-cell lymphoma), who remained 
free of any evidence of relapse of his cutaneous lesions during the 
24-month follow-up period (3).

Dave and Abdelmaksoud (7) reported complete disappearance 
of the lesions in 12 patients with common warts under oral treat-
ment with low-dose isotretinoin (10 to 20 mg every other day); 
however, no definite conclusions can be drawn from their study 
with regard to the therapeutic efficacy of this compound because, 
apart from the oral administration of isotretinoin, “infrequent 
topical application of 5-FU, imiquimod, salicylic or lactic acid, 
and electrocautery was permitted.”

More recently, Herold et al. (8) reported successful treatment 
of recalcitrant common warts in two solid organ transplant recipi-
ents with low-dose oral isotretinoin (20 mg/day) within 6 and 9 
weeks of retinoid administration, respectively. However, because 
both patients were also given candida immunotherapy (0.2 cc eve-
ry 2 weeks), it is impossible to accurately evaluate the therapeutic 
efficacy of isotretinoin in their study.

To the best of our knowledge, the case presented here is the 
first report of an immunocompetent patient with extensive and 
recalcitrant common warts that were successfully treated with 
isotretinoin monotherapy. The response of our patient to this 
retinoid was impressively rapid: considerable reduction in the 
number and size of the lesions was already noted after 2 weeks 
and complete remission after 6 weeks. Another important finding 
is the lack of any relapse after a 23-month follow-up. The possi-
bility of spontaneous resolution of common warts in our patient 
cannot be definitely ruled out, but it is extremely unlikely given 
the protracted course of his disease, the stubborn resistance of 
the disease to all previous treatments, and the rapid response im-
mediately after the initiation of oral isotretinoin administration. 
The treatment was well tolerated by our patient, who experienced 
only minor side effects (cheilitis and dryness of the nasal mucosa 
with occasional epistaxis).

The exact mechanisms underlying the therapeutic effects of 
oral isotretinoin in common warts and other cutaneous HPV in-
fections are far from clearly understood. However, this potent and 
multivalent immunomodulator is known to be capable of induc-
ing apoptosis, down-regulating HPV transcription in affected ke-
ratinocytes, and dramatically affecting epithelial differentiation 
and proliferation (9–11). Because HPV replication is related to the 
state of keratinocyte differentiation (11), it seems reasonable to 
assume that isotretinoin may inhibit DNA replication and assem-
bly of HPV, either through its direct action on HPV, or indirectly 
through modification of epithelial differentiation (11, 12).

Conclusions

Oral isotretinoin monotherapy at a dose of 1 mg/kg/day can be 
considered a highly effective and well-tolerated therapeutic mo-
dality, which can produce rapid, complete, and long-lasting re-
mission of extensive and recalcitrant common warts in both im-
munocompetent and immunocompromised patients.

Figure 1 | Clinical aspect of the extensive common warts on the extensor sur-
face of both underarms (A) before and (B) 6 weeks after onset of oral isotreti-
noin monotherapy. There is complete remission of common warts, whereas in 
some areas isotretinoin-induced discrete fine scales can be seen.
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