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Introduction

Peutz–Jeghers syndrome is an autosomal dominant disease char-
acterized by polyposis of the gastrointestinal tract, pigmentation 
of the skin and mucous membranes, and a predisposition to on-
cological diseases (1).

Peutz–Jeghers syndrome is characterized by the presence of 
multiple hamartomatous polyps throughout the gastrointestinal 
tract, which can cause abdominal pain, chronic bleeding, ane-
mia, and bowel obstruction. Polyps in the gastrointestinal tract 
may develop at any age (2). In addition, hamartomatous polyps 
may have an extraintestinal localization, including in the renal 
pelvis, bladder, bronchi, nasal passages, or gall bladder. Hyper-
pigmentation on the skin and mucous membranes usually devel-
ops in early childhood. The foci are oval or round, ranging from 2 
to 5 mm in size. The color of the spots varies from dark brown to 
black. The spots are localized on the skin (on the face around the 
eyes, mouth, fingers, and feet, and around orifices) and on the 
mucous membranes of the cheeks. With the passage of time, the 
rash on the lips may be resolved, but on the oral mucosa and fin-
gers of the palms it remains for the rest of the patient’s life. This is 
a very important diagnostic sign that persists even in the absence 
of polyps in the digestive tract.

This group of patients has a predisposition to develop malig-
nant tumors with various locations: in the pancreas (3) and large 
intestine (4), and for women in the ovaries (5), cervix (6), and 
mammary glands (7).

Case report

The patient, a girl 4 years 7 months old, has been under our su-
pervision since May 2016. She was admitted with complaints 
about the appearance of depigmentation sites on the skin of the 

face and hands that existed since the winter of 2016. The mother 
was unable to identify any specific cause of the rash on the child’s 
skin.

The past history of disease includes frequent tonsillitis and 
acute respiratory viral infection. The girl’s father suffers from 
psoriasis vulgaris, and the mother has had atopic dermatitis since 
childhood. Allergic anamnesis in the child is negative. The child 
is from her mother’s first pregnancy, which involved no pathol-
ogy. Her birth was physiological on the 40th week of pregnancy, 
without complications.

At the presentation, the girl was well. The weight of the child 
was 27.0 kg, and the child’s height was 119.0 cm. No skeletal anom-
alies were noted. The peripheral lymph nodes were not enlarged. 
The nail plates and hair were unchanged, whereas the visible mu-
cous membranes were free from rash. She had vesicular breath-
ing without wheezing and the abdomen was soft and painless on 
palpation. At the time of admission, multiple depigmented foci on 
the face, trunk, upper, and lower extremities were noted without 
subjective complaints. The child was diagnosed with vitiligo (Fig. 
1). The child was prescribed photoprotective topical medications, 
and consultation with related specialists was recommended. 
Complete blood count, urinalysis, and a basic metabolic profile 
were within normal ranges. In December 2016, during the second 
visit, the mother noted the presence of a rash on the vermillion 
border of the lips and the mucous membrane of the mouth (Figs. 
2–3). She could not relate this rash to any cause. Moreover, the girl 
had no subjective complaints. Objectively, there were several oval 
and round spots ranging from 1 to 3 mm on the vermillion border 
of the left side of lower lip. On the mucosa of the oral cavity, mul-
tiple irregular spots measuring 3 to 5 mm were present. The color 
of the foci varied from light brown to dark brown. The tongue was 
clear and moist. The abdomen was soft upon palpation, and pain-
ful in the epigastric region, whereas symptoms of irritation of the
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peritoneum were absent. There was no hepatosplenomegaly. The 
presence of a rash on the lip and mucous membranes of the oral 
cavity led to suspicion of Peutz–Jeghers syndrome. The child was 
sent to a gastroenterologist for examination, where an abdomi-
nal ultrasound was performed which was within normal limits. 
Esophagogastroduodenoscopy revealed a tubular adenoma in the 
stomach.

Discussion

Peutz–Jeghers syndrome is a monogenic hereditary disease with 
an autosomal dominant type of inheritance. This case differs from 
the cases described by Matini et al. in the absence of a family his-
tory of the symptoms and signs of Peutz–Jegers syndrome (8). In 
connection with the absence of a hereditary history, a new mu-
tation (sporadic case) is likely, which is typical for diseases with 
an autosomal dominant type of inheritance. In this case, the di-
agnosis of Peutz–Jeghers syndrome and benign neoplasm of the 

stomach was confirmed based on complaints, objective data, and 
laboratory and instrumental research methods.

This case is also interesting due to a rare combination of viti-
ligo and Peutz–Jeghers syndrome, which, to the best of our knowl-
edge, was not previously reported.

In most cases, patients with hamartomatous polyps of the gas-
trointestinal tract present with complaints of abdominal pain, 
changes in bowel movement pattern, the presence of blood in 
stool, or symptoms of anemia. In our case, subjective complaints 
were absent. A similar case was described by Mozafarri et al., when 
a 57-year-old patient had primary complaints of pigmentation of 
the oral cavity for more than 15 years but did not experience altered 
functioning of the gastrointestinal system despite the presence of 
multiple hamartomatous polyps in the gastrointestinal tract (9).

Thus, in view of the rare occurrence of Peutz–Jeghers syn-
drome in the presence of a rash on the oral mucosa and vermillion 
border of the lips, it is necessary to perform a gastroenterological 
and genetic examination to confirm this diagnosis.
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Figure 1 | Vitiligo on the face. Figure 2 | Brown spot on the lower lip.

Figure 3 | Brown spot on the oral cavity mucosa.
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